
2025 FDR/CIP BID OPENING

Bid Opening:  September 2, 2025 @ 9:00 am

Opened by:  Andrew Stern, Township Manager

Witnessed by: Dale Getz, Public Works Director & Amy Slutter, Finance Director 

CONTRACTOR ITEM NUMBER QUANTITY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE SUBTOTAL TOTAL

#1   Martin Paving, Inc. High Ridge

1 5,620 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 7.66$                   43,049.20$                   

2 196 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 208.47$               40,860.12$                   

3 5,620 SY Fog Seal 0.90$                   5,058.00$                     

4 303 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 103.27$               31,290.81$                   

5 506 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 103.27$               52,254.62$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 7,000.00$            7,000.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 6,500.00$            6,500.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,200.00$            3,200.00$                     

Subtotal 189,212.75$                 

Sunnyside

1 4,327 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 7.66$                   33,144.82$                   

2 151 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 208.47$               31,478.97$                   

3 4,327 SY Fog Seal 0.90$                   3,894.30$                     

4 260 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 103.27$               26,850.20$                   

5 390 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 103.27$               40,275.30$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 7,000.00$            7,000.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 6,500.00$            6,500.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,200.00$            3,200.00$                     

Subtotal 152,343.59$                 

Raintree

1 5,897 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 7.66$                   45,171.02$                   

2 206 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 208.47$               42,944.82$                   

3 5,897 SY Fog Seal 0.90$                   5,307.30$                     

4 318 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 103.27$               32,839.86$                   

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 103.27$               54,733.10$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 7,000.00$            7,000.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 6,500.00$            6,500.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,200.00$            3,200.00$                     

Subtotal 197,696.10$                 

Raintree CIP ALTERNATE

1 5,897 SY Cold In Place Asphalt Recycling NO BID

2 11,794 gal Css-1h Emulsified Asphalt NO BID

3 530 Ton 9.5 mm Hot Mix Asphalt 1.5" compacted NO BID

4 15 Ton Portland Cement NO BID

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing NO BID

1 PennDOT Mix Design NO BID

6 1 Mobilization NO BID

7 1 Traffic Control NO BID

GRAND TOTAL w/FDR 539,252.44$            

GRAND TOTAL w/CIR NO BID



CONTRACTOR ITEM NUMBER QUANTITY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE SUBTOTAL TOTAL

#2   RECON Construction Services, Inc. High Ridge

1 5,620 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 7.90$                   44,398.00$                   

2 196 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 177.50$               34,790.00$                   

3 5,620 SY Fog Seal 0.60$                   3,372.00$                     

4 303 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 118.30$               35,844.90$                   

5 506 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 118.30$               59,859.80$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 6,400.00$            6,400.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 5,000.00$            5,000.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,600.00$            3,600.00$                     

Subtotal 193,264.70$                 

Sunnyside

1 4,327 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 6.50$                   28,125.50$                   

2 151 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 177.50$               26,802.50$                   

3 4,327 SY Fog Seal 0.60$                   2,596.20$                     

4 260 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 118.30$               30,758.00$                   

5 390 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 118.30$               46,137.00$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 4,500.00$            4,500.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 5,000.00$            5,000.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,600.00$            3,600.00$                     

Subtotal 147,519.20$                 

Raintree

1 5,897 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 7.50$                   44,227.50$                   

2 206 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 177.50$               36,565.00$                   

3 5,897 SY Fog Seal 0.60$                   3,538.20$                     

4 318 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 118.30$               37,619.40$                   

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 118.30$               62,699.00$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 4,500.00$            4,500.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 5,000.00$            5,000.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 3,600.00$            3,600.00$                     

Subtotal 197,749.10$                 

Raintree CIP ALTERNATE

1 5,897 SY Cold In Place Asphalt Recycling 7.20$                   42,458.40$                   

2 11,794 gal Css-1h Emulsified Asphalt 2.60$                   30,664.40$                   

4 15 Ton Portland Cement 180.00$               2,700.00$                     

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 122.15$               64,739.50$                   

1 PennDOT Mix Design 5,000.00$            5,000.00$                     

6 1 Mobilization 10,000.00$          10,000.00$                   

7 1 Traffic Control 3,600.00$            3,600.00$                     

159,162.30$                 

GRAND TOTAL w/FDR 538,533.00$            

GRAND TOTAL w/CIR 499,946.20$            



#3   E.J. Breneman, LLC High Ridge

1 5,620 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 5.60$                   31,472.00$                   

2 196 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 174.00$               34,104.00$                   

3 5,620 SY Fog Seal 0.89$                   5,001.80$                     

4 303 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 97.85$                 29,648.55$                   

5 506 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 96.00$                 48,576.00$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 6,000.00$            6,000.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 8,750.00$            8,750.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 2,700.00$            2,700.00$                     

Subtotal 166,252.35$                 

Sunnyside

1 4,327 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 6.75$                   29,207.25$                   

2 151 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 174.00$               26,274.00$                   

3 4,327 SY Fog Seal 0.89$                   3,851.03$                     

4 260 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 97.85$                 25,441.00$                   

5 390 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 96.00$                 37,440.00$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 3,900.00$            3,900.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 2,850.00$            2,850.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 2,700.00$            2,700.00$                     

Subtotal 131,663.28$                 

Raintree

1 5,897 SY Full Depth Reclamation 12" compacted 5.40$                   31,843.80$                   

2 206 Ton Portland Cement Type 1 174.00$               35,844.00$                   

3 5,897 SY Fog Seal 0.89$                   5,248.33$                     

4 318 Ton 9.5mm 90lb scratch coat and level 97.85$                 31,116.30$                   

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing 96.00$                 50,880.00$                   

6 1 PennDOT Mix Design 3,900.00$            3,900.00$                     

7 1 Mobilization 2,850.00$            2,850.00$                     

8 1 Traffic Control 2,700.00$            2,700.00$                     

Subtotal 164,382.43$                 

Raintree CIP ALTERNATE

1 5,897 SY Cold In Place Asphalt Recycling NO BID

2 11,794 gal Css-1h Emulsified Asphalt NO BID

3 530 Ton 9.5 mm Hot Mix Asphalt 1.5" compacted NO BID

4 15 Ton Portland Cement NO BID

5 530 Ton 9.5mm 1.5" hot mix wearing NO BID

1 PennDOT Mix Design NO BID

6 1 Mobilization NO BID

7 1 Traffic Control NO BID

GRAND TOTAL w/FDR 462,298.06$            

GRAND TOTAL w/CIR NO BID


