DATE:

LOCAT!

BID

ION

PRESENT

BID OPENING FORM

. WASTE & RECYCLABLE MATERIALS COLLECTION

9/30/2021

: BOARD ROOM

TIME:

11:15 AM

: Andrew Stern (WHT), Brenda Baumbach (WHT), Amy Slutter (WHT), Michelle Brown(LCSWMA),

Brian Fuhrman (WM), Andy Warntz (Republic), Joel Washok (PW), Christina Murtaugh (Noble), David Beeman (Noble)

ATTENDED PRE-BID MEETING?
COMPANY 1 COMPANY 2 COMPANY 3 COMPANY 4
BASE BID #1A Waste Management Republic Penn Waste Noble Environmental
UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 171.00 | $ 384.00 | $ 200.16
UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 17784 | $ 403.20 | $ 206.16
UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 184.80 | $ 423.36 | $ 212.34
First Three Year Total $ 533.64 | $ 1,210.56 | $ 618.66
UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 192.00 | $ 44453 | $ 218.71
UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 199.68 | $ 466.76 | $ 225.27
BASE BID #1B
UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 183.00 No Bid 215.40
UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 189.84 No Bid 221.86
UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 196.80 No Bid 228.52
First Three Year Total $ 569.64 [ $ - $ 665.78
UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 204.00 No Bid 235.38
UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 211.68 No Bid 242.44
ALTERNATE BID #2A
UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 171.00 No Bid| $ 200.16
UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 177.84 No Bid| $ 206.16
UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 184.80 No Bid| $ 212.34
First Three Year Total $ 533.64 | $ - $ 618.66
UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 192.00 No Bid| $ 218.71
UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 199.68 No Bid| $ 225.27
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 166.80 No Bid| $ 198.96
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 173.76 No Bid| $ 204.93
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 180.72 No Bid| $ 211.08
First Three Year Total $ 521.28 | $ - $ 614.97
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 188.04 No Bid| $ 217.41
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 195.60 No Bid| $ 223.93
ALTERNATE BID #2B
UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 183.00 No Bid| $ 215.40
UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 189.84 No Bid| $ 221.86
UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 196.80 No Bid| $ 228.52
First Three Year Total $ 569.64 | $ = $ 665.78
UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 204.00 No Bid| $ 235.38
UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 211.68 No Bid| $ 242.44
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF1) No Bid| $ 179.04 No Bid| $ 212.23
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF2) No Bid| $ 185.88 No Bid| $ 218.60
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF3) No Bid| $ 192.84 No Bid| $ 225.16
First Three Year Total $ 557.76 | $ S $ 655.99
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF4)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 200.04 No Bid| $ 231.91
DISCOUNTED UNIT FEE (UF5)-OPTIONAL No Bid| $ 207.72 No Bid| $ 238.87

* Note: The above numbers are provided for convenience. In the event of a conflict, the numbers in the official submitted bid documents prevail.




